
 
 
 

Dear Friends at Eudora Brewing Co, 
 
In the beginning of 2019, you generously funded a portion of charity: water’s work 
in Malawi as a Water Project Sponsor. Today, it’s time to celebrate! We’re thrilled 
to share your Completion Report and tell you more about the work you’ve made 
possible. 
  
100% of your generous donation funded a rehabilitated well with handpump for 
people living in the Ntcheu district of Malawi. 
   
Thanks to you, we’re one step closer to making sure that every single person on 
the planet has access to clean and safe water. Your donation was part of a 
$1,250,000 commitment that funded 161 projects and brought clean water to 
63,973 people! 
  
Our implementing partner, World Vision, uses a programming model that 
prioritizes long-term community partnership. They provide integrated, holistic 
development in communities for about 15 years, or until they can withdraw support 
without jeopardizing continued development. To further increase sustainability, 
the Malawi WASH (water, sanitation, and hygiene) Program focuses on building 
local capacity for the planning, operation, and maintenance of water sources and 
household sanitation facilities, such as latrines and handwashing stations. These 
capacity-building initiatives prepare communities to independently maintain their 
water sources and sanitation facilities both technically and financially. 
 
It’s an honor to present you with this Completion Report. In my role as a Water 
Programs Manager at charity: water, I oversee our partnership, implementation 
strategy, and commitments in Malawi. As a result, I’ve seen how clean water truly 
changes everything for those in need. Health, time, education, opportunities—they 
all improve with access to clean and safe water.  
 
Thank you for helping us transform the future for 63,973 people in Malawi. We are 
profoundly grateful for your support! 

 
Sincerely, 

 
 
 
 
Michaela Walsh 
Water Programs Manager, charity: water
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DATE OF COMPLETION

March 2021

GPS COORDINATES

-14.51541, 34.46292

POPULATION SERVED

287

COUNTRY

Malawi

PROJECT TYPE

Well With Handpump
(Rehabilitated)
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